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Many societies in Europe and Asia are ageing 
rapidly. Changes in the age distribution of a 
society do not only impact welfare and espe-
cially pension systems, but they can also in-
fluence political systems on a broader level, 
for example through age effects on turnout. In 
other countries we observe shifts in the ethnic 
or religious composition of the population. 
These shifts might impact election results, 
power relationships within society and be-
tween political parties or even individual vot-
ing behavior. Migration, as another prominent 
demographic factor, influences politics as 
well. It is thus obvious that demography im-
pacts politics.  

This relationship is of course bidirectional: 
Reproductive policies that enable or hinder 
women's control over reproductive decisions, 
and subsequently affect fertility rates, provide 
a clear example of the impact of politics on 
demographics. Other demographic factors 
that are shaped by politics and policies in-
clude mortality rates and migration flows. 

Even though interactions between demo-
graphic factors and politics are frequent and 
powerful, the intersection of political science 
and population studies has for a long time re-
mained under-researched. This is now slowly 
beginning to change (e.g. Goldstone, Kauf-
mann & Duffy Toft 2012, Teitelbaum 2015, 
Goerres & Vanhuysse 2021) – a process we 
would like to support. In this special issue we 
thus invite contributions to the field of political 
demography.  

We especially invite submissions on the fol-
lowing areas and topics: 

• Ageing Societies/Changes in the age 
structure of societies and politics 

• Reproduction and politics 

• Demography, conflicts, and violence 

• Demography and democracy 

• Migration, politics and policies 

• Data-based theoretical contributions to the 
field 

We accept the submission of research notes 
(5,000 words max.) and full articles (9,000 
words) for this special issue. 

Rewarding outstanding work  

In 2023 and 2024 the Board of Editors will 
award the Emil J. Gumbel Prize to the author 
of an outstanding contribution published in 
Statistics, Politics and Policy.  

The reward includes a financial incentive of 
500 USD.  

Manuscripts should be submitted until 
September 30th, 2023.  

All documents are to be handed in via our of-
ficial SPP ScholarOne online center:  
http://mc.manuscriptcentral.com/dgspp  

Pre-formatting to our publication style is not 
necessary. Final formatting is required only 
after acceptance. As a hybrid journal we offer 
classical and open-access publication op-
tions. For author guidelines and further infor-
mation on Statistics, Politics and Policy visit 
the website:   

https://www.degruyter.com/journal/key/spp/html 

You may also contact the Guest Editor 
(kira.kurz@politik.uni-freiburg.de) with ques-
tions. Manuscripts will be subject to a double-
blind peer-review process. Accepted papers 
will be published in Statistics, Politics and Pol-
icy ahead-of-print in late 2023 or early 2024.  

Kind regards,  

Kira Renée Kurz, Guest Editor 
(kira.kurz@politik.uni-freiburg.de) 
 

Prof. Dr. Uwe Wagschal, Editor-in-Chief 
(uwe.wagschal@politik.uni-freiburg.de) 
 

Dr. Felix Ettensperger, Managing Editor  
(felix.ettensperger@politik.uni-freiburg.de) 

 
 

  

 


